THE UNITED REPUBLIC OF TANZANIA

An Act to amend certain Written Laws.

ENACTED by the Parliament of the United Republic of Tanzania.

1. This Act may be cited as the Written Laws (Miscellaneous Amend-  Short title
ments) (No. 3) Act, 2002.

2. The laws set forth in columns 1 and 2 of the Schedule to this Act Amend-

. . . t of
are hereby amended in the manner specified in column 3 of that :l;nai,:

Schedule. laws



CoLumn 1 CoLumn 2 CoLumn 3
Act No. 10 of The Trade Unions Act, The Trade Unions Act, 1998 is amended in the Schedule by deleting the word “three”
1998 1998 which appears at the last line of paragraph 3 and substituting for it the word “five”;
Act No. 8 of The National Health Insur- The National Health Insurance Fund Act, 1999 is amended —
1999 ance Fund Act, 1999

(a) insection 2 by repealing that section and substituting for it the foliowing:

“Applica- 2.~(1) This Act shall apply to all public servants other than the following
tion categories:
(a) a judge;

(b) a member of defence forces;

(c) a member of police force;

(d) a member of intelligence services;

(¢) a member of a council, board, panel or committee; and

(f) aperson holding office the emolument of which is payable at an hourly
rate or daily rate.

(2) The Minister may, after consultation with the Board and by notice
published in the Gazette, determine any other category of public servant to be a
member of the Fund and the types of benefit package which may be granted to
the beneficiary of the Fund”

(b) in section 3, by deleting the definition of the words “civil servant” and substituting for it
the following —

“public servant” for purposes of this Act, extends to and includes every person
holding a public office invested with or performing duties of public nature, whether
under the immediate control of the President or not, and includes an officer under
control of a local government authority but does not include a person holding such
office only on part time basis™;

[4

ST 'ON

(S1uswipuawy snoaupjjaosipy) SMOT udiiLiy

2007



CoLumn |

CoLumN 2

CoLumN 3

(c) by deleting the words “civil servant” wherever they appear in the Act, and substituting for
them the words “public servant”;

(d) insection 9, by adding immediately after subsection (2) the following subsection—

“(3) Every contribution due under this section shall be paid to the Fund within one
month after the last day of contribution period to which it relates.”

() insection 12, by deleting subsection (3);
(f) insection 14, by adding immediately thereafter the following section —

“Cesssation 14A.—(1) Membership shall cease if the employment of a member is deter-

of mined by one of the following circumstances —
member-
ship (a) death of a member;

(b) termination from employment;

(c) retirement from employment;

(d) dismissal from employment; or

(e) any other act that may terminate the employment of a member.

(2) Notwithstanding subsection (1 ), any person who was a beneficiary of the
Fund shall be entitied to the benefit package for a period of three months after the
occurrence of any circumstances specified undersubsection (1), following which
the benefit package and membership shall cease.

(3) The period of receiving the benefit package under this subsection may be
reviewed by the Board.”;

(g) insection 15, by adding immediately after subsection (2) the following subsections—

ST "ON

(Srusupusuty snoaulaosipy) SmoT ustniy

2007

£



CoLumN |

CoLumN 2

CoLUMN 3

“(3) The member shall collect identity cards from his children, who have
attained the age of eighteen years, or dependants who cease from being lawful
beneficiaries of the Fund and surrender them to the employer.

(4) The employer shali collect all the identity cards from the employees who
ceased from being members of the Fund together with those of the children and
dependants submitted to him by a member, and submit them to the Director
General.

(5) The Fund shall, where a member or employer fails to execute his duties
under subsection (3) and (4), recover from such member or employer, as the case
may be, all expenses incurred by the Fund as a result of using identity cards after
cessation of membership.”;

(h) insection 17—

“(i) by deleting paragraph (c).”
“(ii) by renaming paragraphs (d), (e), (f), (g), (h) and (i) as paragraphs (c), (¢), (f), (g) and
(h) respectively”;
(iii) by deleting paragraph (f) as renamed and substituting for it the following paragraph:
“(f) compensation for partial and total incapacity which is covered under other
schemes™;

“(iv) by adding immediately after paragraph (i) the following paragraphs—

(j) wmortuary services and burial expenses;
(k) transport to and from a health facility;
() subsistence allowance while treated outside his working station”.;

(i) insection 18, by adding immediately after that section the following proviso—

14

ST "ON

(S1uawpusuty Snosup[jaoSIpy) SMADT Uty

2007



CoLumn |

CoLumn 2

CoLumN 3

ActNo. 26 of 1973

The National Social Welfare
Training Institute Act, 1973

“Provided that the Fund shall provide medicine and medical treatment in accor-
dance with the provisions of this Act and the provisions of Regulations made
thereunder.”

The National Social Welfatre Training Institute Act, 1973 is amended—

(a) by deleting the words “National Social Welfare Training Institute” which appear in the
long title, and substituting for them the words “Institute of Social Work”;

(b) by deleting the words “National Social Welfare Training Institute” appearing insection
1 and substituting for them the words “Institute of Social Work:”

(c) by deleting the words “National Social Welfare Training Institute” wherever they
appear in the Act, and substituting for it the words “Insitute of Social Work.”;

(d) insection 9~

(i) by deleting subsection (1) and substituting for it the following—

*(1) The Ministershali, on recommendation of the Board, appoint a suitable
person to be the Principal of the Institute”.

(ii) by deleting the words “subject to approval by the Minister” appearing in subsec-
tion (3) and substituting for them the words “stated in the instrument of appoint-
ment.”;

(iti) by deleting subsection (4);
(e) insection 10, by deleting subsection (1) and substitutiﬁg for it the following —

“(1) The Principal shall be the chief executive officer of the Institute and the Secre-
tary to the Board™.

(f) in section 11, by deleting the whole of that section and substituting for it the
following —

§T "ON

(S1usmpuauy snoaunjjadsipy) SMoT usLiy

007



COLUMN 1

CoLumN 2 CoLumn 3

“Appoint- 11.—(1) The Senior administrative and academic staff of the Institute shall be
ments appointed by the Board.

(2) The junior members of staff of the Institute shall be appointed by the
Principal.”;

(g) in the Schedule—
(i) by deleting paragraph 2(b) and substituting for it the following:

“(b) not more than ten and not less than seven members who shall be appointed
by the Minister”;

(ii) by deleting paragraph 4, and substuting for it the following paragraph—

“4. The tenure of office of Board members shail be three years from the date
of appointment and shall be eligible for reappointment:

Provided that, any new Board shall have at least one third of the outgoing
members.:’

(iii) by deleting paragarph 11 and substituting for it the following—

“Decision 11. All questions at a meeting of the Board shall be decided by the
m majority of the votes of members present and voting at the meeting”

(iv) by deleting paragraph 1 3(2Xb);
(v) bye renumbering paragraph 13(2)c) as 1 3(2)(b);
(vi) by deleting paragraph 1 4(b);

(vii) by renumbering paragraph | 4(c) as 14(b).

9

ST ON

(S1usupuswly SNO2UDIIIISIPY) SMDT UL

2007



CoLumn | CoLumn 2 CoLumn 3
Act No. 11 of The Tanzania Revenue Autho- The Tanzania Revenue Authority Act, 1995 is amended by repealing section 19 which
1995 rity Act, 1995 relates to “Appeals Board and Appeals Tribunal”
ActNo.1 of 1985  The Elections Act, 1995 The Elections Act, 1985 is amended by repealing section 111 and replacing it by the

following:

“Petition
and
procedure
for deposit
of security
Act No.
13 of 1990
s.19
Act No. 6
of 1992
s.51

111.—(1) An election peititon may be presented by one or more of the
following persons, namely—

(a) a person who lawfully voted or had a right to vote at the election to
which the petition relates;

(b) a person claiming to have had a right to be nominated or elected at
such election;

(c) & person alleging to have been a candidate at such election;
(d) the Attomey General.

(2) The Registrar shall not fix a date of the hearing of a petition unless the

petitioner has paid into the court, as security for costs, an amount not exceeding
five million shillings in respect of each respondent.

(3) The petitioner shall within fourteen days after filing a petition, make an
application for determination of the amount payable as secrurity for costs, and
the court shall determine such application within the next fourteen days follo-
wing the date of filing an application for determination of the amount payable as
security for costs.

(4) Where any person is made a respondent pursuant to an order of the court,
the petitioner shall within fourteen days of the date on which the order directing
a person to be joined as a respondent was made, pay into the court a further
amount not exceeding three million shillings, as shall be directed by the court in
respect of such person,

ST "ON

(sruswpuswy snoaup)assipy) smoT uanriy

007



CoLumn |

CoLumN 2

COLUMN 3

Act No. 401979

The Local Authorities (Elec-
tions) Act, 1979

(5) Where, on application made by the petitioner, the court is satisfied that
compliance with the provisions of subsections (2) or (4) will cause considerable
hardship to the petitioner, it may direct that—

(a) the petitioner give such other form of security the value of which does not
exceed five million shillings, as the court may consider fit or

(b) the petitioner be exempted from payment of any form of security for costs.

(6) No ordershall be make undersubsections (3), (4) and (5) unless an oppor-
tunity has been given to the respondent, or, where there are two or more respo-
ndents, to each of the respondents to make representations in that behalf.

(7) In the event of security for costs not being paid into the court within
fourteen days from the date of determination by the court of the amount payable
as security for costs, no further proceedings shall be had on the petition,

(8) The provisions of subsections (2) and (3) shall not apply to the Attorney
General in any case in which the Attomey General is the petitioner or one of the
petitioners.

(9) The amount of money deposited as security for costs or the balance of it
shall, where the petitioner succeeds in the petition or on appeal and where no
order as to costs lies against the petitioner, be immediately refunded to the
petitioner”

The Local Authorities (Elections) Act, 1979 is amended by repealing section 110 and re-
placing it by the following:-

“Petitions
and de-
posit of se-
curity Act
No. 4 of
2000

110.—(1) An election petition may be presented by one or more of the
following persons, namely—

(a) a person who lawfully voted or had a right to vote at the election to
which the petition relates;

8

§C ON

(SrudwpuaWy SNOUD]IISIP) SMADT UL

007



CoLumn |

COLUMN 2

CoLumN 3

(b) a person claiming to have had a right to be nominated or elected at
such election;

(c) a person alleging to have been a candidate at such election;
(d) the Attorney General.

(2) The Registrar shall not fix a date of the hearing of a petition unless the
petitioner has paid into the court, as security for costs, an amount not exceeding
five hundred thousand shillings in respect of each respondent.

(3) The petitioner shall within fourteen days after filing a petition, make an
application for determination of the amount payable as security for costs, and the
court shall determine such application within the next fourteen days following
the date of filing an application for determination of the amount payable as secu-
rity for costs.

(4) Where any person is made a respondent pursuant to an order of the court,
the petitoner shall within fourteen days of the date on which the order directing a
person to be joined as a respondent was made, pay into the court a furtheramount
not exceding two hundred thousand shillings, as shall be directed by the court in
respect of such person.

(5) Where, on application made by the petitioner, the court is satisfied that
compliance with the provisions of subsections (2) or (4) will cause considerable
hardship to the petitioner, it may direct that—

(a) the petitibnergive such other form of security the value of which does not
exceed five hundred thousand shillings, as the court may consider fit;
or

(b) _the petitioner be exempted from payment of any form of security for costs.

ST "ON

(Stuswpuowy snoaupjiaostpy) SMDT uantiy

007



CoLumn |

CoLumn 2

CoLumN 3

Act No. 15 of
1979

Act No. 49 of
1966

The Appellate Jurisdiction
1979

The Civil Procedure Code
1966

(6) No order shall be made undersubsection (3), (4) and (5) unless an oppor-
tunity has been given to the respondent, or, where there are two or more respo-
ndents, to each of the respondents to make representations in that behalf,

(7) In the event of security for costs not being paid into the court within
fourteen days from the date of the determination by the court of the amount
payable as security for costs, no further proceedings shall be had on the petition.

(8) The provisions of subsectisons (2) and (3) shall not apply to the Attorney
General in any case in which the Attorney General is the petitioner or one of the
petitioners.

(9) The amount of money deposited as security for costs or the balance of it
shall, where the petitioner succeeds in the petition or on appeal and where no
order as to costs lies against the petitioner, be immediately refunded to the peti-
tioner”;

The Appellate Jurisdiction Act, 1979 is amended in subsection (2) of section 5 by deleting
paragraph (d) and substituting for it the following—

“(d) no appeal or application for revision shall lie against or be made in respect of any
preliminary or interlocutory decision or order of the High Court unless such
decision or order has the effect of finally determining the criminal charge or suit”.

The Civil Procedure Code 1966 is amended—
(a) is section 74—
(i) by designating section 74 as section 74(1 );
(i) by adding immediately after subsection (1) the following subsection—
“(2) Notwithstanding subsection (1), no appeal shall lie against or be made in

respect of any preliminary or interlocutory decision or order of the High Court
unless such decision or order has the effect of finally determining the suit.”;

01

ST "ON

(Siudupuswy snosunjlassipy) smo uanriy

00T



CoLumn |

CoLumn 2

CoLumn 3

Act No. 2 of
1984

The Magistrates’ Courts
Act, 1984

{b) insection 78~
(i) by designating that section as section 78(1);
(ii) by adding immediately after subsection (1) the following —

“(2) Notwithstanding the provisions of subsection (1), no application for re-
view shall lie against or be made in respect of any preliminary or interlocutory
decision or order of the Court unless such decision or order has the effect of finally
determining the suit.”;

{c) insection 79—
(i) by designating that section as section 79(1);
{if) by adding immeditely after subsection {1) the following subsection —

“(2) Notwithstanding the provisions of subsection (1), no application for
revision shail lie or be made in respect of any preliminary or interlocutory
decision or order of the Court unless such decision or order has the effect of
finally determining the suit.”;

The Magistrates’ Courts Act, 1984 is amended—
(a) insection 40 by—
(i) deleting the words “twelve million” appearing in paragraph (a) of subsection (2),
and substituting for them the words “one hundred and fifty million”;
(i) deleting the word “ten million” appearing in paragraph (b) of subsection (2) and
subtituting for them the words “one hundred million”,
(k) insection 43 by—
(i) adding immediately after subsection (1) the following subsection—

“(2) Subject to the provisions of subsection (3), no appeal or application for
revision shall lie against or be made in respect of any preliminary or interlocu-
tory decision or order of the district court or a court of a resident magistrate

anless such decision or order has the effect of finally determining the criminal

charge or the suit”.

700

ST 'ON

(Studtupuswy SNOUDJI2ISIPN) SADT UdIILY

7

Il



CoLumn | CoLumN 2 CoLumn 3
(ii) renumbering subsection (2) as subsection (3);
(c) in the Third Schedule by—
{i) deleting the words “ten thousand” appearing in subparagraph (1)(b) of
paragraph 2 and substituting for them the words “five hundred thousand”
(ii) deleting subparagraph (4)X(a) of paragraph 2 and substituting for it the following-
“(a) Amount Maximum Period
Not exceeding Shs. 5,000/= ......cccoveveiveirivennines 14 days
Exceeding Shs. 5,000/= but not exceeding
Shs. 50,000/= .......ccoevririvennnicnsnninissiensieens 1 month
Exceeding Shs. 50,000/= but not exceeding '
Shs. 100,000/= ........cocvvriereeerrererrassrneeressereseesos 3 months
Exceeding Shs. 100,000/= but not exceeding
Shs. 500,000/= .....cocorvvrirrrrersenevsrsasesessecsassanens 4 months
Exceeding Shs. 500,000/= ........ccccovceverencrenrnes 5 months”
(iii) deleting the word “one thousand™” appearing in subparagraph (1 )(b) of
paragraph 5 and substituting for it the words “one hundred thousand”.
Cap. 16 The Panel Code Cap. 16 The Panel Code is amended in section 29 by deleting the Schedule appearing under

paragraph (iv) and substituting for it the following— -

“Not exceeding Shs. 5,000/= ........cevevuimnnimnnvennnneesesnissssisenianes

Exceeding Shs. 5,000/= but not exceeding 50,000/~=

Exceeding Shs. 50,000/= but not exceeding Shs. 100,000/= .............. 6 months
Exceeding Shs. 100,000/= but not exceeding Shs. 500,000/=............ 12 months

Exceeding shs, 500,000/ ..o 24 months”

Al

ST ‘ON

(SIuaWpUsWy SNOSUDIIIISIPY) SMDT UMY

7007



CoLumn 1~

CoLumn 2

CoLumN 3

Act No. 9 of
1985

Cap. 35

The Criminal Procedure
Act, 1985

The Public Holidays
Ordinance

The Criminal Procedure Act is amended—

CY

(b

©

@

insection 170, by deleting the words “twenty thousand” appearing in paragraph (b) of
subsection (1) and substituting for them the words “twenty million™;

in section 359 by adding immediately after subsection (2) the following subsection—

“(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of subsections (1 ) and (2), no appeal shall lie
against or be made in respect of any preliminary or interlocutory decision or order of
a subordinate court unless such decision or order has the effect of finally determining
the criminal charge.”;

in section 372 —

(i) designating that section as section 372(1);
(i) by adding immediately after subsection (1) the following subsection—

“(2) Notwithstanding the provisions of subsection (1), no application for
revision shall lie or be made in respect of any preliminary or interlocutory deci-
sion or orderof a subordinate court unless such decision or order has the effect of
finally determining the criminal charge.”

in section 378, by adding immediately after subsection (2) the 'following subsection-

“(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of subsection (1) and (2), no appeal shall lie
against or be made in respect of any preliminary or interlocutory decision or order of
a subordinate court unless such decision or order has the effect of finally determining
the criminal charge.”;

The Public Holidays Ordinance is amended in the Schedule, by adding the following item-

“The Mwalimu Nyerere Day and the Climax of the Uhuru Torch Race (1 4* October),”

ST "'ON

(S1uswpuswy Snosuv|jaISIp) SMOT ULUY

7007

el



CoLumn 1 CoLumN 2 CoLumn 3
Act No. 8 of The Public Service Act, The Public Service Act, 2002 is amended in section 6 by—
2002 ' 2002
(a) inserting a “comma” after the word “confirmation” which appears in paragraph (b) of
subsection (1) and thereafter inserting the word “promotion”;
(b) deleting subsection (6).
ActNo. 12 of Customs Tariff Act, 1976 The Customs Tariff Act, 1976 is amended in the First Schedule—
1976

(a) in Part B—

(i) by inserting additional National Note to Chapter 73 immediately after Note 2 as
follows:

“National Additional Note

1. Subheading 7308.90.10 includes roofing tiles with pertinent accessories,
clad, plated or coated”;

(i) by inserting additional National Note to Chapter 87 immediately after Note 4 as
follows:

“National Additional Note
1. Subheading 8702.10.20 excludes three door (hard top) motor vehicles.”;

(iii) by adding the following subheadings with their tariff rates phase down as speci-
fied in the following Schedule—

14!

ST 'ON

(Sruauipusutly SNO2uD|I20SI) SMADT Uiy

007



“Headﬂ

HS Code

Description

Unit

IMPORT DUTY

2001

2002

2003

2004

2005

2006

2007

2008

2009

2010

2011

2012 |

73.08

Structures (excluding
prefabricated buildings
of heading No. 94.06)
and parts of structures,
(For example, bridges
and bridge-sections,
lock-gates, tower, lattice
masts, roofs, roofing
frame-works, doors and
windows and their
frames and thresholds
for doors, shutters, bal-
ustrades, pillars and col-
umns) of iron or steel;
plates, rods, angles,
shapes , sections, tubes
and the like, prepared
for use in structures of
iron or steel

-~ Other

7308.90.10

- - Roofing tiles with
accessories

25%

25%

25%

25%

25%

25%

25%

15%

15%

10%

5%

0%

7308.90.90

- - Other

Kg

0%

0%

0%

0%

0%

%

0%

0%

0%

0%

0%

0%

ST ‘ON

(SIuaUWPpUIUE SNOPUDIISISIPN) SMDT UBIILLY

007

S



“Hmding

HS Code

Description

Unit

IMPORT DUTY

2001

2002

2003

2004

2005 2007} 2008

2010

2011

2012

73.10

Tanks, casks, drums,
cans and similar con-
tainers, for any material
(other than compressed
or liquefied gas), of iron
orsteel, of a capacity not
exceeding 300/, whether
or not lined or heat-in-
sulated, but not filled
with mechanical or ther-

mal equipment

- Of'the capacity of less
than 50/

- - Other

7310.29.20

- - Beverage cans, tins
and ends

0%

0%

0%

0%

0% 0% | 0%

0%

0%

- 0%

0%

87.02

Motor vehicles for the
transport of ten or more
persons, including the
driver

- With compression
ignition combustion
piston engine (diesel
or semi-diesel)

91

(SIUBUPUILY SNOJUDJIPOSIIY) SMDT Uty ST ‘ON

00T



“Heading

HS Code

Description

Unit IMPORT DUTY

2001 | 2002 2003} 2004| 2005| 2006 2007} 2008} 2009] 2010 2011 | 2012

8702.10.20

- - Of cubic capacity
0f 2000 or more and
seating capacity
not exceeding ten
persons

U | 25%]25% | 25%| 25%] 25%| 25% | 25%]|25% | 15% | 0% | 0% | 0%

- Other

8702.90.20

- - Of cubic capacity of
2000 or more and
seating capacity
not exceeding ten
persons

U | 25%|25% | 25%} 25%| 25%| 25% | 25%|25% |15%} 0% | 0% | 0%

(b) inPartC—

(i) by inserting additional National Note to Chapter 73 immediately after Note 2 as
follows:

“National Additiona! Note

1. Subheading 7308.90.10 includes roofing tiles with pertinent accessories,
clad, plated or coated”;

(ii) by inserting additional National Note to Chapter 87 immediately after Note 4 as
follows:

“National Additional Note
1. Subheading 8702.10.20 excludes three door (hard top) motor vehicles.”;

(iii) by adding the following subheadings with their tariff rates phase down as speci-
fied in the following Schedule—

ST ‘ON

(Siuswpusuy SROUDJIIOSIH) SMDT UdLLY

2007

Ll



“Headin,

HS Code

Description

Unit

IMPORT DUTY

2001

2002

2003

2004

2005 2006 2007} 2008

2009

2010

2011

2012

73.08

Structures (excluding
prefabricated buildings
of heading No. 94.06)
and parts of structures,
(For example, bridges
and bridge-sections,
lock-gates, tower, lattice
masts, roofs, roofing
frame-works, doors and
windows and their
frames and thresholds
for doors, shutters, bal-
ustrades, pillars and col-
umns) of iron or steel;
plates, rods, angles,
shapes , sactions,. tubes
and shy like, gropared
for ve in. strwetuees of

_ironorswll

i B

e WA TN R e S e
=

4
7308.90.10

- - Roofing tiles with
accossorics

Kg

25%

25%

25%

25%

25%) 25%| 25%| 15%

15%

10%

5%

0%

7308.90.90

-« Other

Kg

%

0%

0%

0%

0% | 0% 0%

0%

0%

0%

0%

81

ST "ON

(S1udwpusuty Snoauvja0s1py) SMOT uditLiy

007



“Heading

HS Code

Description

Unit

IMPORT DUTY

2001

2002

2003

2004

2005] 2006( 2007 2008

2009

2010

2011

2012

73.10

Tanks, casks, drums,
cans and similar con-
tainers, for any material
(other than compressed
or liquefied gas), of iron
or steel, of capacity not
exceeding 300/, whether
or not lined or heat-in-
sulated, but not filled
with mechanical or
thermal equipment

- Ofthe capacity of less
than 50/

- - Other

7310.29.20

- - Beverage cans, tins
and ends

0%

0%

0%

0%

0%

0% | 0% | 0%

0%

0%

0%

%

87.02

Motor vehicles for the
transport of ten or more
persons, including the
driver

With compression
ignition combustion
piston engine (diesel
or semi-diesel)

ST 'ON

(Siuawpuawy snoaupjaoSIpy) SMDT ULy

007

61



“Heading | HS Code Description Unit IMPORT DUTY
2001 | 2002} 2003) 2004 2005| 2006 2007] 2008] 2009] 2010] 2011 | 2012
87021020 -- Of cubic capacity
of 2000 or more
and seating capacity
not exceeding ten
persons U | 25%|25% | 25%| 25%| 25% 25% | 25%]25% {15%] 0% | 0% | 0%
- Other
8702.90.20 { -- Ofcubiccapacityof | U |25% |25% [25% | 25% |25% |25% | 25% 5% |15% | 0% | 0% | 0%
2000 or more and
seating capacity
not exceeding ten
persons
Couumn 1 Corumn 2 CoLumn 3
“(c) these amendments shall be read as one with Part IV of the Financial Laws
Act No. 10 (Miscellaneous Amendments) Act, 2002 and shall be deemed to have come
of 2002 into operation on the 7* June, 2002”.
Cap. 212 The Companies Ordinance The Companies Ordinance is amended in section 331 B-

(8) by deleting subsection (3) and substituting for it the following:

“(3) Where a company in which the Government or its agent owns shares under-
goes divestiture in accordance with the provisions of any written law relating to
privatization, the provisions of this Ordinance, or any other written law, articles, in-
strument or charter of the company which relates to preemptive rights of shareholders,
shall not apply in relation to the shares of that company:

0T

ST "ON

(S1uawpusuty snoouppjasstpy) smoT uspiy

007



Couumnl Cowumn 2 CoLumN 3

Provided that, where the value of the shares which are the subject of preemptive
rights has been derived from an open and transparent valuation process, the Treasury
Registrar shall offer a first right of refusal to the other shareholder orshareholders, as
the case may be.”

(b) by inserting the following paragraph immediately after the proposed subsection (3);
“The amendment of subsection (3) shall be read as one with the Written Laws

ActNo.2  (Miscellaneous Amendments) Act, 1998 and shall be deemed to have come into
of 1998 force on the 27* March, 1998,

ActNo. 18 The Fina- The Finance Act, 2002 is amended—
of 2002 nce Act,
2002 (a) in section 34 which ralates to the amendment of the Income Tax Act, 1973, by

deleting paragraph (a) and substituting for it the following—
‘(a) insubsection (2)Xw), by deleting paragraph (ii) of the pro-
viso and substituting for it the following proviso:
“(ii) the Provisions of this subsection shall aply to any
investment made on or before the 30th June, 2002
by a corporation holding a certificate of incentives
granted by the Tanzania Investment Centre pursu-
ant to the provisions of the Tanzania Investment Act,
1997

Passed in the National Assembly on the 14™ November, 2002.

......................... vsressrensseransanes

Clerk o fthe National Assembly

Printed by the Government Printer, Dar es Salaam - Tanzania

§T "ON

(Sruawpuswy snoauvjjaastpy) sMoT usntiy

007

¥4



